
DANGER: COMBUSTIBLE 

LIQUID. MAY BE FATAL 

IF SWALLOWED AND 

ENTERS AIRWAYS. CAUSES 

SKIN IRRITATION. MAY 

CAUSE AN ALLERGIC SKIN REACTION. MAY CAUSE 

DROWSINESS OR DIZZINESS. KEEP OUT OF REACH OF 

CHILDREN.

Precautionary statement

Prevention: Keep away from heat / sparks / open fl ames 
/ hot surfaces. - No smoking. Avoid breathing mist or 
vapor. Wash thoroughly after handling. Use only outdoors 
or in a well-ventilated area. Contaminated work clothing 
must not be allowed out of the workplace. Wear protective 
gloves / eye protection / face protection.

Response: If swallowed: immediately call a poison center 
/ doctor. If on skin: Wash with plenty of water. If inhaled: 
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Remove person to fresh air and keep comfortable for 
breathing. Call a poison center / doctor if you feel unwell. 
Do NOT induce vomiting. If skin irritation occurs: Get 
medical advice / attention. Take off contaminated clothing 
and wash before reuse. In case of fi re: Use appropriate 
media to extinguish. 

Storage: Store in a well-ventilated place. Keep container 
tightly closed. Store in a well-ventilated place. Keep cool. 
Store locked up.

Disposal: Dispose of waste and residues in accordance 
with local authority requirements.

This product is a “Hazardous Chemical” as defi ned by 
the OSHA Hazard Communication Standard, 29 CFR 
1910.1200. One or more components are not listed on 
TSCA.

Additional safety measures:

Read the entire label and SDS before using this product, 
and for additional fi rst aid measures. SDS for this product 
is available on the web at www.nclonline.com
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DIRECTIONS FOR USE:  Apply by spray, brush, soak tank, automatic scrubber, pressure washer, steam cleaner, mop, 
cloth or sponge.  Allow suffi cient contact time for the product to work, agitate if necessary.
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